
My objection to  Google's Project Loon, as well as any other space-based wifi 
projects, like Space X's wifi satellites, and Facebook's wifi satellites and drones, is 
that a small group of technocrats do NOT have the right to decide to blanket the 
earth in microwave radiation on the assumption that every corner of humanity 
must have, and desperately wants, this technology.  This assumption is false.  It is 
the height of arrogance for profit-making entities to make such a decision for the 
rest of the earth's inhabitants, especially when it imposes a health, privacy and 
environmental risk for them.  This manmade microwave radiation technology has 
gotten completely out of hand.  In the frenzy to make quick bucks, as well as spy 
on people and control them, not to mention dumbing them down and damaging 
their health (which brings in more profits), every corner of our public spaces is 
being blanketed with this toxin, our homes, our schools and workplaces, our 
environment, our automobiles, and now space.  I don't think God gave these 
domains to a few less than ethical technology companies.  And our government 
should not either.  It is not to be ignored that the elite, in their own words, have 
championed population reduction, which this does magnificently.  (see David 
Rockefeller's biography, for example).  This radiation makes people sick.  I know 
because I get sick when I am in a heavily radiated environment.  I also know 
because of the hundreds and thousands of sources out there, expert and 
scientific, which have proven this.  (see cellphonetaskforce.org, c4st.org, 
mercola.com, Ron Powell's articles on scrib.com/doc/291507610)  There is no 
doubt of this, despite the fraudulent 1996 Telecommunications Act that industry 
lobbyists passed.  Not only does it make people sick, it damages DNA and cells, 
reproduction, clear thinking, migration of birds and bees, causes cancers, the list 
goes on.  The military would not use microwave as weaponry if this were not the 
case.  Something that is weaponry to them, should not be forced on us.  Poison is 
poison.  The Google balloons would try to force radiation into unserved areas.  
This is criminal.  They would also pose a hazard of interfering with airplanes, 
drones, electric lines, homes, and also of crashing, which balloons do frequently.  
They are subject to wind and weather, and must be replaced frequently.  They 
could also be used to spy  on the public.  This whole idea is terrible.  Likewise, wifi 
satellites would just increase the microwave radiation already coming from 



weather satellites, spy satellites, military satellites, communication satellites, etc.  
Arthur Firstenburg, at cellphonetaskforce.org lists infant mortality results which 
clearly spike every time a new satellite is launched and adds a new layer of 
radiation.  Dr. Joseph Mercola at mercola.com has said that brain cancer is the 
leading cancer killer in children replacing leukemia.  This change directly 
correlates with the increase in wireless technologies being forced onto everyone.
This technology is so lethal….long term and short term, that it should be outlawed 
and dismantled, and would be if good people were in positions of authority 
everywhere.  (There are safe alternatives such as landline phones, cable, DSL, 
fiber optics and ethernet).  IF it is allowed to continue, there should be, at the least, 
a choice of safe vs unsafe technologies (free market) and areas set aside where 
this is banned from use, such as schools, public transportation, public libraries, 
public universities, rural areas, etc.  The future of humanity and our earth is at 
stake.  Please do NOT approve any applications for this type of technology to be 
imposed on humanity.
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